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For Immediate Release 
 
CENTRAL SEMICONDUCTOR Expands its Distribution Agreement with FUTURE 
ELECTRONICS to cover EMEA 
 
Hauppauge, NY USA – January 21, 2014 – Central Semiconductor Corp., a leading manufacturer of innovative 
discrete semiconductors, today announced that it has expanded its Distribution Agreement with Future 
Electronics, one of the top worldwide broadline distributors of electronic components, headquartered in Montreal 
Canada, into EMEA.  
 
“We are pleased to be adding Future on board in the EMEA territories after forging a successful affiliation in 
North America over the past ten years,” said Al Simon, Vice President of Worldwide Sales and Marketing at 
Central Semiconductor. “Future has the geographical presence and logistical expertise to expand the Central 
brand throughout Europe and we look forward to continuing to expand our relationship.”  
 
Andy Keenan, Vice President Marketing EMEA, added “With the expansion into EMEA, we look forward to 
working closely with Central Semiconductor. Their ease of doing business and stocking position makes this a 
win-win for both companies.”  
 
Central Semiconductor Corp., established in 1974, is headquartered in Hauppauge, Long Island, New York. 
Central designs and manufactures high quality innovative discrete semiconductors for today’s latest electronic 
products serving the consumer, industrial, alternative energy, communications, computer, avionics, and 
automotive markets. Central’s product focus includes highly energy efficient ultra miniature devices with superior 
electrical performance, as well as custom multi discrete modules, and diminishing source product support for 
older technology devices. For further details on Central Semiconductor’s products and capabilities, visit 
www.centralsemi.com 
 
Future Electronics is a global leader in electronics distribution, ranking 3rd in component sales worldwide, with 
an impressive reputation for developing efficient, and comprehensive global supply chain solutions. Founded in 
1968, the company has established itself as one of the most innovative organizations in the industry today, with 
5,000 employees in 169 offices in 44 countries around the world. Future Electronics is globally integrated, with 
one worldwide IT infrastructure providing real-time inventory availability and access, while enabling full 
integration of its operations, sales and marketing worldwide. Offering the highest level of service, the most 
advanced engineering capabilities and technical solutions through all stages of the design-production cycle, and 
the largest available-to-sell inventory in the world, Future’s mission is always to Delight the Customer®. For 
more information, visit www.FutureElectronics.com. 
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